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Investigation Completed Officer Involved Shooting 

The Illinois State Police have completed their independent investigation regarding the officer-involved shooting that 
occurred at Brian Bemis Toyota at 1890 Sycamore Road in DeKalb on October 23, 2024.  State’s Attorney Rick Amato has 
also completed a review of the incident and has concluded that the officers were justified in their use of force. 

On October 23, 2024, the DeKalb Police Department received numerous 9-1-1 calls beginning at 12:25 PM of an upset 
customer who was threatening people with two large knives.  Before officers arrived, further statements from callers 
included information that the individual had broken windows and stabbed an employee.  Officer Bollow and Chief Byrd 
were the first two DeKalb Police officers to arrive.  Upon their arrival, multiple people were fleeing out of the front door 
of the business, with one of them stating the individual was inside breaking things.  When the two officers entered, they 
immediately encountered the individual, Charles Tripicchio, who had a large knife in each hand.  Officer Bollow knew 
Tripicchio from prior calls and called him by name, ordering him to drop the knives.  Tripicchio did not drop the knives, 
and instead turned around and walked away from the officers.  He then turned a corner into a corridor and walked out 
of sight.  Upon the officers turning the corner, both continued to order Tripicchio to drop the knives, and he 
refused.  Tripicchio turned to face the officers, then raised his right arm and said, “hey look!” and threw one of the 
knives at Officer Bollow, prompting both officers to fire their handguns at Tripicchio.  Instead of surrendering, Tripicchio 
took additional steps towards Chief Byrd, while still holding the other knife in his left hand.  With Tripicchio closing the 
short distance between himself and Chief Byrd, officers fired again until he spun around and fell down.  That second 
knife then dropped to the floor and was kicked out of the way by one of the officers.  Additional officers arrived at this 
point and immediately began to render first aid to Tripicchio.  The knife that Tripicchio threw at Officer Bollow was 
found lodged directly into a wall behind where Officer Bollow had been standing, with the knife blade penetrating 
entirely into the drywall. 

Tripicchio remains in medical care and is awaiting additional court hearings on the charges that were previously filed 
against him.  

An additional independent review of the incident was conducted to ensure relevant department policy and protocols 
were followed.  Officers were determined to be in compliance.  Both Chief Byrd and Officer Bollow, who had been 
assigned to administrative duties in the meantime, will now be returned to full duty. 

https://youtu.be/iBM_XHo_b7Q?feature=shared
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### 
**All persons are presumed innocent in a court of law until proven guilty** 

If you witnessed this incident or have any information that can help with this investigation, please contact the DeKalb 
Police Department. 
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